

**2021 Bid Tabulation Sheet**

Denotes lowest bidder

NO BID - Denotes no bid

NR denotes not responsive

**GASOLINE AND DIESEL FUEL - 21 - 0013**

	Central Oil &Supply	Lott Oil Co.	Mansfield Oil	Petroleum Traders		
Regular Total	0.2300	0.2050	0.2078	0.1969		
Ultra Low Sulfur Dyed Diesel	0.0300	0.0100	0.0207	0.0114		
Clear Diesel	0.2300	0.1950	0.2197	0.2101		

**ASPHALT PRODUCTS - 21 - 0010**

No bids received

Tack	
------	--

**AGGREGATE - 21 - 0022**

	Sierra Frac sand	Benton & Brown	Granite Mountian	
Washed Gravel	\$26.00	NO BID	NO BID	
#67 Granite	NO BID	NO BID	\$33.50	
#57 Granite	NO BID	\$34.00	\$33.00	
#610 Granite	NO BID	\$31.00	\$29.50	
#67 Limestone	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
#57 Limestone	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
#610 Limestone	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
Crushed concrete (class II specifications)	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
30lb rip rap	NO BID	\$40.00	\$39.00	
Coarse sand	\$14.00	\$28.00	NO BID	

**REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE - 21 - 0018**

	Southwest Sales	Coatal Culvert	Co-Heir		
12", 8 FT. JOINTS	NO BID	NO BID	\$18.00		
15", 8 FT. JOINTS	NO BID	NO BID	\$20.00		
18", 8 FT. JOINTS	NO BID	NO BID	\$21.00		
24", 8 FT. JOINTS	NO BID	NO BID	\$33.00		
30", 8 FT. JOINTS	NO BID	NO BID	\$47.00		
36", 8 FT. JOINTS	NO BID	NO BID	\$64.00		
42", 8 FT. JOINTS	NO BID	NO BID	\$87.00		
48", 8 FT. JOINTS	NO BID	NO BID	\$108.00		
54", 8 FT. JOINTS	NO BID	NO BID	\$132.00		
60", 8 FT. JOINTS	NO BID	NO BID	\$156.00		
72", 8 FT. JOINTS	NO BID	NO BID	\$214.00		

**PLASTIC CULVERT PIPE - 21 - 0018**

Double-wall HDPE Pipe	Southwest Sales	Coastal Culvert	Co-Heir		
12", 20 ft lengths per linear foot	\$4.90	\$6.00	\$5.90		
15", 20 ft lengths per linear foot	\$6.65	\$8.00	\$7.75		
18", 20 ft, lengths per linear foot	\$8.75	\$11.50	\$10.95		
24", 20 ft, lengths per linear foot	\$14.70	\$18.00	\$17.15		
30", 20 ft, lengths per linear foot	\$21.00	\$27.00	\$25.85		
36", 20 ft, lengths per linear foot	\$28.00	\$35.00	\$33.25		
42", 20 ft lengths per linear foot	\$40.25	\$40.00	\$38.30		
48", 20 ft lengths per linear foot	\$47.60	\$52.00	\$49.00		
60", 20 ft lengths per linear foot	\$80.50	\$98.00	\$91.25		

Ribbed PVC Pipe					
12", 22 ft lengths Per linear ft	NO BID	\$10.00	\$8.25		
15" 22 ft lengths Per linear ft	NO BID	\$12.00	\$10.75		
18" 22 ft lengths Per linear ft	NO BID	\$18.00	\$15.00		
24" 22 ft lengths Per linear ft	NO BID	\$30.00	\$28.50		
30" 22 ft lengths Per linear ft	NO BID	\$42.00	\$40.00		
36" 22 ft lengths Per linear ft	NO BID	\$55.00	\$52.00		

Double Wall Polypropylene Pipe					
12", 20 ft lengths Per liner ft	NO BID	NO BID	\$8.00		
15", 20 ft lengths Per liner ft	NO BID	NO BID	\$8.50		
18", 20 ft lengths Per liner ft	NO BID	NO BID	\$11.15		
24", 20 ft lengths Per liner ft	NO BID	NO BID	\$19.05		
30", 20 ft lengths Per liner ft	NO BID	NO BID	\$29.80		
36", 20 ft lengths Per liner ft	NO BID	NO BID	\$32.45		
42", 20 ft lengths Per liner ft	NO BID	NO BID	\$42.75		
48", 20 ft lengths Per liner ft	NO BID	NO BID	\$54.15		
60", 20 ft lengths Per liner ft	NO BID	NO BID	\$87.00		

Steel Reinforced Polyethylene (SRPE) Pipe					
72", 24 ft lengths Per linear ft	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
84", 24 ft lengths Per linear ft	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
96", 24 ft lengths Per linear ft	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
108", 24 ft lengths Per linear ft	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
120, 24 ft lengths Per linear ft	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
72", 14 ft lengths Per linear ft	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
84", 14 ft lengths Per linear ft	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
96", 14 ft lengths Per linear ft	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
108", 14 ft lengths Per linear ft	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
120", 14 ft lengths Per linear ft	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		

**CORRUGATED METAL CULVERTS - 21 - 0018**

	Southwest Sales	Coastal Culvert	Co-Heir		
16 gauge 12" Asphalt coated, 10 to 24' Per linear ft	\$12.83	\$14.29	\$14.35		
16 gauge 15" Asphalt coated, 10 to 24' Per linear ft	\$15.98	\$17.99	\$18.10		
16 gauge 18" Asphalt coated, 10 to 24' Per linear ft	\$19.13	\$22.88	\$22.95		
16 gauge 24" Asphalt coated, 10 to 24' Per linear ft	\$25.43	\$28.88	\$28.95		
16 gauge 30" Asphalt coated, 10 to 24' Per linear ft	\$31.50	\$36.75	\$36.85		
16 gauge 36" Asphalt coated, 16 to 20' Per linear ft	\$37.80	\$43.23	\$43.30		
16 gauge 42" Asphalt coated, 16 to 20' Per linear ft	\$44.33	\$56.03	\$56.30		
16 gauge 48" Asphalt coated, 20' Per linear ft	\$50.63	\$66.17	\$66.65		
14 gauge 54" Asphalt coated, 20' Per linear ft	\$69.98	\$103.22	\$93.25		
14 gauge 60" Asphalt coated, 20', 3"x1" or 5" x1" corrugations	\$77.85	\$112.48	\$113.35		
14 gauge 72" Asphalt coated, 20", 3"x1" or 5" x1" corrugations	\$92.70	\$147.48	\$147.65		
14 gauge 78" Asphalt coated, 20", 3"x1" or 5" x1" corrugations	\$100.35	\$158.92	\$159.15		
14 gauge 84" Asphalt coated, 20", 3"x1" or 5" x1" corrugations	\$108.00	\$171.22	\$172.05		
14 gauge 90" Asphalt coated, 20", 3"x1" or 5" x1" corrugations	\$115.43	\$181.03	\$182.10		
14 gauge 96" Asphalt coated, 20", 3"x1" or 5" x1" corrugations	\$170.01	\$194.17	\$196.05		

**TREATED YELLOW PINE PILING - 21 - 0016**

No bids received

13" Butt, or 12" /3' in 25 to 50 ft. Lengths treated creosote oil	
14" Butt or 13" /3' in natural taper 51 to 60 ft. lengths, traeted creosote oil	
13" Butt or 12" /3' natural taper in 25 to 50 ft. lengths, treated CCA	
14" Butt, or 13" /3' natural taper in 51 to 60 ft. lengths, treateed CCA	

**TREATED YELLOW PINE LUMBER - 21 - 0014**

No bids received

3 x 8 x 12, and 14 ft. treated Crosote oil	
6 x 12 x 16 ft rough treated Creosote oil	
12 X 12 X 26 ft. rough treated Creosote oil	
6 x 6 x 16 ft. rough treated Creosote oil	
3 x 10 x 28 ft. rough treated Creostoe oil	
3 x 8 x 12, and 14 ft. treated CCA	
6 x 12 x 16 ft. rough treated CCA	
12 x 12 x 26 ft. rough treated CCA	
6 x 6 x 16 ft. rough treated CCA	
3 x 10 x 28 ft. rough treated CCA	

**ASPHALTIC COLD MIX - 21 - 0012**

Diamond B

Type D – High Performance (per ton)

Delivered to Benton	\$110.00
Picked up at plant	\$87.00

**PETROLEUM PRODUCTS - 21 - 0015**

Central Oil      Lott Oil

Diesel Motor Oil-SAE grades 10w-50w Per Gallon	\$5.84	\$6.47
Gear Oil –SAE 90 & 140 (Special MP Type) Per Pound	\$0.96	\$1.28
Automatic Transmission Fluid Per Gallon	\$5.73	\$5.18
Universal Tractor Hydraulic Fluid Per Gallon	\$4.50	\$5.39

**HOT MIX - 21 - 0011**Benton and  
Brown

HOT MIX (per ton)	\$73.00
-------------------	---------

**TIRES - 21 - 0021**Southern      Gateway  
Tire Mart      tire

13.00 X 24 GRADER TIRE – 10 PLY, G 2 – MG OR EQUAL	\$272.50	\$285.00		
460/85R38 TRACTOR TIRE, R 1 TREAD	\$1,047.70	\$510.00		
14.9 X 28 TRACTOR TIRE, R 1 TREAD	\$298.60	\$310.00		
14.9 X 24 TRACTOR TIRE, R 1 TREAD	\$292.95	\$275.00		
10.00 X 16 TRACTOR TRI RILE	\$133.85	\$133.00		
11.2 X 24 TRACTOR TIRE, R 1 TREAD	\$167.08	\$166.00		
16.9 X 34 TRACTOR TIRE, R 1 TREAD	\$439.08	\$644.00		
16.9 X 30 TRACTOR TIRE, R 1 TREAD	\$383.53	\$394.00		
9.5 L X 15 TRACTOR TIRE	\$90.42	\$99.00		